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In this descriptive corpus-based study, we used both parallel and comparable reference corpora in 
the English-Polish language pair (i.e. Paralela, NKJP, plTenTen12) to explore, first, how translators 
dealt with recurrent multi-word items performing specific discoursal functions; second, whether the 
observed tendencies overlap with the ones found in native texts originally written in contemporary 
Polish; and third, to what extent the discoursal functions realised by n-grams under scrutiny are 
"preserved" in translation. Capitalizing on earlier research by Granger (2014) and Grabar and Lefer 
(2015) in a different language pair (English-French), we analyzed a randomly and proportionally 
selected set of eight phrases signaling stance-taking (4 items) and those functioning as textual, 
discourse-structuring devices (4 items), which were extracted from the Europarl corpus (Koehn 
2005) as included in the English-Polish parallel corpus Paralela (Pezik 2016).  
Apart from identifying typical and peripheral (i.e. less frequent) Polish equivalents, including 
various single-word and phrasal equivalents, we explored them in terms of how frequently those 
equivalents are employed in native Polish texts using suitable comparable corpora, namely Other 
Conversation Data sub-corpus of the National Corpus of Polish (NKJP), a full balanced NKJP 
corpus and plTenTen12 mega-corpus of Polish). It was revealed that some of the Polish equivalents 
in translation are rarely used in native contemporary Polish texts of the same genre. Also, using 
suitable inter-rater agreement metrics (raw inter-rater agreement, Cohen’s Kappa and Krippendorf’s 
alpha), the evaluation of bilingual text fragments by 4 annotators (2 English and 2 Polish ones 
respectively) revealed that discoursal functions of polyfunctional recurrent n-grams, with the 
English phrase at the end of the day as a case in point, may change in the Polish translation. This is 
may be due to the fact that the meaning and function of such recurrent items emerges in a particular 
situation of language use, and as such it may be either preserved or modified in the course of the 
translation process (e.g. translators may overlook a figurative interpretation of a phrase and opt for a 
literal one); the source-text message may also be understood differently when a target recipient uses 
the text at a later time in a different situational context and with a different purpose in mind (as it 
was the case of the annotators).  
Although the findings offer interesting and new descriptive data, still more research is required – 
using more sophisticated inferential statistics – to arrive at any wider generalizations as to the 
observed tendencies in translation. Likewise, more research is required to explore the rationale 
behind the modification of the discourse functions conveyed by the Polish equivalents or behind the 
alternative renditions that could have been selected by translators. 
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